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Subject: Information Regarding Revolade

REQUEST & RESPONSE

The purpose of these questions is to understand the variability of treatment
within your trust and in context to the rest of the country.

Q1. How many patients has your trust treated (for any disease) in the last 6
months (or the latest 6 months data you have available) with the following
treatments:

. Revolade (eltrombopag) 19 Patients issues 1/10/2021 - 31/03/2022

. Nplate (romiplostim) <5 Patients issues 1/10/2021 - 31/03/2022
Please note <5 has been added where the number of patients is 5 or less, this
information has been redacted to protect patient confidentiality and to ensure
that patients can not be identified.

. Doptelet (avatrombopag) O Patients

. Tavlesse (fostamatinib) 0 Patients

Q2. In the last 6 months (or the latest 6 months data you have available), how
many patients has your trust treated for immune thrombocytopenia (ITP)?

The Trust do not hold this information. To identify if treated would need
a manual review of records and this exceeds cost limit.

Under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act St Helens &
Knowsley Teaching Hospitals Trust does not have to comply with a
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request if we estimate that the cost of complying with your request
would exceed the appropriate limit of £450. The appropriate limit has
been specified in regulations. This represents the estimated cost of one
person spending 2% working days in answering the remainder of your
guestions. Under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act the
Department is not obliged to comply with your request and we will not
be processing your request further.

Q3. Of the patients treated for immune thrombocytopenia (ITP) in the last 6
months (or the latest 6 months data you have available), how many were
treated with:

rituximab
mycophenolate mofetil
surgery (splenectomy)

The Trust do not hold this information. To identify if treated would need
a manual review of records and this exceeds cost limit.

Under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act St Helens &
Knowsley Teaching Hospitals Trust does not have to comply with a
request if we estimate that the cost of complying with your request
would exceed the appropriate limit of £450. The appropriate limit has
been specified in regulations. This represents the estimated cost of one
person spending 2¥2 working days in answering the remainder of your
guestions. Under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act the
Department is not obliged to comply with your request and we will not
be processing your request further.

Q4. Does your trust participate in any ongoing clinical trials for immune
thrombocytopenia (ITP)? If so, can you please provide the name of each trial
along with the number of patients taking part?

There are no current trials for ITP.
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